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No shock as Metro Fitness, Stockport chooses Gerflor

“I wanted to go with flooring that was highly durable and that would cope with the
volume of use, whilst being relatively forgiving to higher impact exercise”
George Stylianou, Director, Metro Fitness 

Metro Fitness in Stockport owned by
European boxing champion Matthew
Hatton and his father, Ray Hatton, has
installed Gerflor Taraflex™ flooring for
their Stockport gym complex. The
business was launched as a premium-
offer budget gym in August 2012 and has
since then gone from strength to strength,
growing their membership year on year. 

George Stylianou, Director, Metro Fitness
said, “The growing popularity in functional
exercise amongst our members had
prompted research into further
developing our existing space. I wanted to
go with flooring that was highly durable
and that would cope with the volume of

use, whilst being relatively forgiving to
higher impact exercise”. It was therefore
no shock that Metro Fitness chose
Taraflex™ from Gerflor- the no. 1
preferred indoor sports solution for over
60 years as their preferred floor covering
throughout the gym.

George Stylianou was quoted as saying,
"this gym has attracted a whole new
market, namely those who may have
previously considered joining a gym but
have been put off by the inflated prices,
hidden extra costs and long term
commitments. "We are also attracting gym
members who have become disillusioned
with the lack of customer service,
cleanliness and general upkeep of both
equipment and facilities."  George
Stylianou went onto further comment,
‘’having noticed the Gerflor advert in
Leisure Management, I felt that their new
Taraflex™ product might be a good fit.  He
went on to also add, ‘’I read the
testimonials and having viewed the
product for myself; I commissioned the
installation, which I have to say, was
extremely efficient and professional
throughout’’.

Taraflex™ has been used in every summer
Olympics since 1976 and is available in 17
colours and two wood-effect designs. The
Sport M Evolution product offers a very
high P1 category shock absorbency which
exceeds 25% and meets the EN 14904
Standard for indoor sports surfaces.
Taraflex™ is recognised for providing
durability, safety and comfort without
impairing performance. 
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The range also offers greater than 45%
force reduction, making it unrivalled in the
marketplace in terms of offering comfort
for users.  Bespoke designs are also
available by either water cutting, HD
printing or line marking. Taraflex™ also
meets the EN Standard of 22196 for anti-
bacterial activity (E. coli - S. aureus -
MRSA) (3) returning >99% levels of
growth inhibition. The product is also
treated with Protecsol®, which renders
polish redundant. Taraflex™ has a double
density foam backing and is
environmentally friendly.

George Stylianou finally commented, “the
biggest compliment I can make is that the
feedback is extremely positive, both from
our resident professional boxers and
coaches, including Matthew Hatton and
from our ever-increasing membership,
who thoroughly enjoy using the space;
either when exercising alone with Battle
Ropes, Kettlebells, Tractor tyres or as part
of a group exercise class”.

For full specification details please contact us by phone, fax, email

• P1 category: 25 to 35% shock absorption

• Triple-Action Protecsol® Surface Treatment

• D-Max™ Multi-layer Surface

• CXP HD™ Foam Backing

• Sanosol® Antibacterial and Fungicidal Treatment

Technical Properties
Product 

Description

TaraflexTM Sport

M Evolution

Surface treatment Triple Action
Protectsol®

Double Density 
CXP-HDTM

7mm

4.6kg/m2

26.4lm max

1.5lm

P1

< 2mm

> 0.31m/s

> 90%

< 350mg

> 8N/m

< 0.5mm

Dry-TexTM System

Cfl-s1

Foam

D-MaxTMSurface complex

Thickness EN 428

Weight EN 430

Length EN 426

Width EN 426

Sport Properties

Shock absorption EN 14808

Vertical deformation EN 14809

Energy return NF P 90 203

80 - 110Sliding coefficient EN 13036-4

Ball bounce EN 12235

Technical Characteristics

Abrasion resistance EN ISO 5470-1

Impact resistance EN 1517

Indentation resistance EN 1516

Installation system

Classification

Fire EN 13501-1

Sanosol®Special treatment

CE Marking

EN 14041CE


